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I have decided that I am going to try something different from writing
lengthy and time consuming articles. Sharing information is what this
website was created to do and I would like to do that in a way that is
quick to write and quick to read. I don't know how all of this will work
at this point and the configuration is likely to change as things
progress, but I liked posting random information in my article
"Banned Again for "No Reason was Specified". 
It allowed me to share some important information quickly and
hopefully effectively. 

As of this writing, my intention is to simply write and post whatever
comes to my attention. Rather than creating a new link for every little
comment that I want to share, I intend to just date and post that
information in this article, much like a continuous log book or diary.
The newer information will be posted at the bottom of this page, with
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the date that it was entered. If the page gets too long, I'll create
another "Random" link on the homepage and 
continue on. If this does not work out, we will try something else. 
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Here is another video about police drones patroling Los Angeles: 

Robocops to patrol LA by 2025  http://www.youtube.com/watch?
v=u2Ja_Sil2GU 
 
or
 
http://www.kissyourillusionsgoodbyeevidenceroom.com/videos-page-
1-9/Robocops-to-patrol-LA-by-2025mp4-107893

What do you think is the end game in all of this if the New World
Order has it's way? 

I have made several posts in several threads about money. 

Some people (maybe most people) talk about paper "money" as if it's
real. Some people posting in the forum are adamant that the top of
the New World Order is controlled by "big bankers". Most of these
people believe this nonsense because they are constantly told that
by people like New World Order insider Alex Jones. Everything is
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about money with tese NWO controlled "alternative news media
types, but they are lying to us. 

Here is reality: 

1. You and I are REAL. People are real. 

2. Time is REAL. A 40 hour work week is real. 

3. The itmes produced by people during that 40 hour work week are
REAL. 

4. The paper "money" that people are paid as wages is FAKE. 

5. Governments and banks create paper "money" from nothing. It
has no physcial backing. 

6. The government uses REAL physical force to impose the paper
"money" on people. They will not allow people to work in this country
without being "paid" with fake paper "money". 
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7. "Fiscal cliff"???? Seriously???? What a hoax. If there is a "cliff", it's
because the New World Order is ready to drastically alter our lives by
manipulating this paper "money" in such a way that causes great
distress in the nation. 

8. So we have real people spending real time producing real
products for fake paper "money" that the satanic government creates
from nothing while using real force to impose upon the population. 

If "money" and banksters are at the top of the New World Order, why
do they care about having all the paper "money" when they create it
all? They are using "money" as a tool. Paper "money" is a TOOL,
just like a carpenter uses a hammer to build a house. I don't know of
anyone who owns a hammer just to have a hammer. People own
hammers because it is a useful tool for creating something. 

Paper "money" is a lie. 

There is NO "fiscal cliff". 

What we are seeing is the complete destruction of the USA by the
2nd beast of Revelation 13, which is an occupying force that is
enslaving us and the entire world through the use of the USA military
while calling itself "GOVERNMENT". 
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2 Corintians 11:14 And no marvel; for Satan himself is transformed
into an angel of light 

The 2nd beast of Revelation is deceiving the world world. 

Revelation 12:9 And the great dragon was cast out, that old serpent,
called the Devil, and 
Satan, which deceiveth the whole world: he was cast out into the
earth, and his angels were cast out with him. 

So..... what is the New World Order's end game? 

What the New World Order wants is the products and services that
people are currently spending their lives producing while being paid
with worthless pieces of paper. The "fiscal cliff" is the New World
Order preparing you for the REALITY that paper "money" has NO
value. They are going to remove the illusion of value and offer you
something else. 

Is the "Mark of the Beast" very far away now? 

RFID CHIP EVERYONE-FEDERAL LAW 
http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=fQmpCxx-kNo 
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There are two kinds of people who talk about the USA Constitution: 

1. People who don't know that it's gone. 

2. People who know that it's gone but they want to continue to
deceive the people who don't know. 

Here is an article by the New World Order insider Alex Jones. Mr.
Jones is all about deception. 

Obama Teams Up With Foreign Media and Governments to
Destroy Second Amendment 
http://www.infowars.com/foreign-media-lectures-americans-on-gun-
rights/print/ 

Now stop and think....... If the USA Constitution is gone, there can
NOT be a 2nd Amendment. 

Senate Report 93-549 War and Emergency Powers Acts 
http://www.barefootsworld.net/war_ep1.html 
Search that page for the word 1933 and read a little. 

Senate Report 93-549 War and Emergency Powers Acts,
Executive Orders and the New World Order 
http://www.barefootsworld.net/war_ep.html 
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Search that page for the word majority and read a little. 

America's Constitutional Dictatorship 
http://freedom-school.com/truth/waract.htm 
Read the whole short page. 

Alex Jones is an extremely intelligent person. He knows about what I
just showed you. So why is he writing about the 2nd amendment if
he knows that it is gone? 

The "Law" is the primary tool used by the New World Order to
enslave you and me. I have written several times about "the law".
Now I want you to pay attention to what the mass brainwashing tool
has to say about "the law". 

From the current TV series "Arrow" 

Notice the 2:00 mark when the judge says "our's isn't a court of
justice, it's a court of law". 

Did you get that? 

Everywhere you turn, the New World Order is telling us what they are
doing, what they are thinking, what they intend to do in the future. 

Once you accept that the New World Order is real, you will start to
see and hear what was always there to be seen and heard but you
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did not have the knowledge and understanding to grasp it. 

Arrow 1x04 An Innocent Man
http://www.kissyourillusionsgoodbyeevidenceroom.com/-9/arrow-
104--part-13mp4-108571

Since there is no Constitution and no 2nd amendment, why is the
satanic government still acting like it exists? They have lied to us our
entire lives. They can't just barge in and say the Constitution is gone.
They have to do things incrementally, like TSA molesting flyers. Little
by little, people are accepting the unacceptable. 

When are you going to peacefully stop submitting to this satanic
government? What is that last straw for you? 
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How much more information do people need to see before they
realize that the Terrorist Insurgents are now occupying the USA
White House and Congress? 

These Militant Extremists are showing us that the whole system is a
hoax. 
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Could $1 trillion coin solve the debt crisis? 
http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=SW0XTbQzo8Q 
 
or
 
http://www.kissyourillusionsgoodbyeevidenceroom.com/videos-page-
1-9/Could-1-trillion-coin-solve-debt-crisismp4-107892
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The Last Enemy 2008 PBS Masterpiece Theater (5 part series) 

This show is not really "important" information, but it does show us
what is coming. 
http://www.youtube.com/playlist?list=PLHGiOx2YCzesMHM5-
EiXJnsHvC-4hERsb 
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The previous video about the $1 Trillion coin is the New World Order
mocking the American people for being so incredibly naive and
gullible. Who can blame the New World Order for laughing? 
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Who is going to enforce martial law when it happens? Some people
are saying that they don't know anyone in the military who will do
such a thing. Hmmm....... 

There is a small army of roughly 58,000 TSA employees now. Before
9-11, how many of those people thought that they would be strip
searching grandma or making mothers drink their breast milk or they
would be searching a baby's dirty diaper or....... 

Yeah..... those people are "heroes" for sure. If they were in the
military, they would never act against the American people if they
were told to it. Search a dirty diaper? You BET!!! but they would
never use force to enslave us. They have scruples. 

Before 9-11, how many people thought to themselves...... sure, I'll let
some pervert strip search me so that I can take a plane ride. If they
do it in front of the entire airport, what do I care? I'm going on
vacation. 

As long as we are dealing with fairy tales today, let's watch one that
tells almost exactly the same story as the $1 Trillion Coin story. 

Hans Christian Andersen - The Emperor's New Clothes 
http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=-ZYzbkk5X4M
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